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2024 /634 - Vehicles of Interest (VOI)

In response to your recent request for information regarding;

1. Please provide the number of Vehicles of Interest (VOI) at the time of your response on
your system for each of the below categories.

High PNC Action marker -
Medium PNC Action marker -
Low PNC Action marker -
Lost/Stolen PNC marker -
Hotlist entry -

We currectly have 9 o/s as off today stolen reports added in March
We did have 21 reported as stolen through March.

2. Please provide the number of Vehicles of Interest (VOI) added in March 2024 to your
system for each category of alert, save 'Hotlist entry'.

I am aware of the National ANPR Standards for Policing & Law Enforcement (NASPLE)
accessible via weblink: National ANPR standards - GOV.UK (www.gov.uk)

North Wales Police do not hold this information. Data is weeded every 28 days and March VOI lists no
longer are held on record.

3. Please provide the most recent internal training material/resources (or similar in nature)
created that has relevance to officers determining what category of alert a Vehicle of
Interest (VOI) should be added to.

North Wales Police do not hold this information. This is covered on the advanced training course which
is ran by the Home Office and not in force.

4. Please provide the full name/title of the e-form used by officers and staff when
nominating a Vehicle of Interest to the ANPR system

North Wales Police do not hold this information. There is no specific e-form for this. OSS intelligence
create a csv excel sheet obtaining the details of vehicles of interest from Niche ( intelligence system)
and then upload them direct to the ANPR system.

5. Some VOIs will be nominated by officers and staff via an e-form. Please provide a copy of
this form (i.e. a template copy or a completed form but appropriately redacted to ensure no
disclosure of personal data)

North Wales Police do not hold this information. There is no e-form for this. It is a generic excel sheet
which they send us and we convert to a csv excel to upload or in some cases the ANPR team will
create the excel on receipt of an email detailing the vehicles to be added.
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https://eur03.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.gov.uk%2Fgovernment%2Fpublications%2Fnational-anpr-standards&data=05%7C02%7CFreedomofInformationTeam%40northwales.police.uk%7C71e30252b1fb46d4982108dc97390a79%7C4e86b176a10e43bd8d27927f44d0e665%7C0%7C0%7C638551518444109738%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=e2bSFSQHUJ267GAFNQGdXUcOwK5JjsuwpDaLK4AQvLM%3D&reserved=0

THIS INFORMATION HAS BEEN PROVIDED IN RESPONSE TO A REQUEST
UNDER THE FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000, AND IS CORRECT AS AT 28/06/2024
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