



HEDDLU
GOGLEDD CYMRU
NORTH WALES
POLICE

Response Date:01/09/2026

2026/852 - Yellow Box Junction Fines

In response to your recent request for information regarding;

I am writing to request information relating to Penalty Charge Notices (PCNs) issued by the authority for yellow box junction contraventions.

For the purposes of this request, I am referring specifically to PCNs issued for vehicles entering and stopping in a yellow box junction when prohibited.

I would be grateful if you could provide the following information:

Q1. The total number of PCNs issued for yellow box junction contraventions during each of the following periods:

1 January to 31 December 2023

1 January to 31 December 2024

1 January to 31 December 2025

1 January to 31 July 2026

If figures to 31 July 2026 are not yet available, please provide figures to the latest complete month available and specify the period covered.

Please note: the offence code is RT88751 – however we do not hold this data by cause of the offence, ie box junction road markings. This information could not be checked without viewing every ticket manually as the main offence title is 'Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non- endorsable traffic sign'.

OFFENCE_DATETIME	CCCJS_OFFENCE_DESC
05/01/2023 20:50	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
12/01/2023 15:05	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
22/01/2023 15:45	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
24/01/2023 22:00	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
25/01/2023 14:30	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign -

Pencadlys yr Heddlu,
Glan-y-Don, Bae Colwyn LL29 8AW
www.heddlugogleddcymru.police.uk

Police Headquarters,
Glan-y-Don, Colwyn Bay LL29 8AW
www.northwales.police.uk

Yn gwneud Gogledd Cymru'r lle mwyaf diogel i fyw, gweithio ac ymweld yn y DU
Making North Wales the safest place to live, work and visit in the UK

	detected by means other than ACD
27/01/2023 19:40	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
31/01/2023 12:45	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
08/02/2023 02:40	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
11/02/2023 16:22	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
20/02/2023 17:45	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
08/03/2023 15:33	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
27/03/2023 13:40	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
05/06/2023 09:04	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
12/06/2023 15:08	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
14/06/2023 16:20	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
15/06/2023 08:50	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
21/06/2023 15:50	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
25/06/2023 00:15	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
19/07/2023 08:42	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
19/07/2023 11:55	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
06/09/2023 10:18	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
13/09/2023 11:09	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
14/09/2023 11:00	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
21/09/2023 15:00	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
23/09/2023 01:00	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
01/10/2023 16:20	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
21/01/2024 00:20	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
09/04/2024 14:28	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
11/04/2024 17:30	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
19/04/2024 15:05	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
19/04/2024 15:05	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign -

	detected by means other than ACD
07/05/2024 14:31	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
04/06/2024 16:50	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
06/06/2024 20:40	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
07/06/2024 21:30	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
08/06/2024 12:10	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
15/06/2024 17:40	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
01/09/2024 11:10	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
31/10/2024 23:50	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
05/11/2024 12:30	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
16/11/2024 09:17	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
27/11/2024 09:04	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
13/12/2024 22:30	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
23/12/2024 14:20	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
02/01/2025 16:25	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
18/01/2025 11:50	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
03/02/2025 15:54	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
13/02/2025 10:21	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
18/02/2025 19:20	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
18/03/2025 17:35	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
25/03/2025 17:30	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
02/04/2025 18:07	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
20/04/2025 15:25	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
23/04/2025 09:05	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
01/05/2025 15:00	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
02/05/2025 22:20	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
15/05/2025 09:20	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign -

	detected by means other than ACD
01/06/2025 20:45	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
18/07/2025 15:00	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
19/07/2025 22:50	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
30/09/2025 09:20	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
16/10/2025 08:50	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
24/10/2025 23:30	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
07/11/2025 15:00	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
07/11/2025 15:00	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
09/11/2025 12:28	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
11/11/2025 15:10	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
17/11/2025 15:20	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
30/11/2025 20:45	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
02/12/2025 15:00	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
18/12/2025 15:10	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
18/12/2025 15:10	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
18/12/2025 15:10	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
21/12/2025 11:33	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
27/12/2025 18:50	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
14/01/2026 22:56	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
22/02/2026 11:00	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
09/03/2026 09:10	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
12/03/2026 09:10	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
17/03/2026 16:15	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
21/03/2026 20:40	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
17/04/2026 11:16	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
23/04/2026 15:10	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign -

	detected by means other than ACD
07/05/2026 19:55	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
08/05/2026 23:00	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
14/06/2026 12:20	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
28/06/2026 15:30	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD
06/07/2026 15:10	Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non endorsable traffic sign - detected by means other than ACD

Our information is set up and searchable for our policing purposes. To even comply with Section 1 (1) (1) of the Freedom of Information Legislation (which is the duty to inform the applicant whether or not information is held by the authority) would be above the amount to which we are legally required to respond i.e. the cost of retrieving the information exceeds the 'appropriate level' as stated in the Freedom of Information (FOI) Fees and Appropriate Limit regulations 2004.

Therefore, in accordance with the FOI Act 2000 the information you have requested is exempt under Section 12 (2), and this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 (5) of the legislation.

Q2. For each of the periods above, please provide the five yellow box junction enforcement locations where the highest number of PCNs was issued, including:

The road, junction or enforcement location name.

The number of PCNs issued at that location.

If fewer than five yellow box junction locations were enforced during any of the periods above, please provide figures for all locations enforced.

Please see the answer to Q1 above.

Q3. For each of the periods above, please provide the total amount received by the authority from yellow box junction PCNs issued during that period.

If revenue is not recorded according to the date on which the PCN was issued, please provide the information in the format in which it is held and explain the basis used.

The fine amount is £50.

However, fines are not collected by North Wales Police.

Q4. For yellow box junction PCNs issued during each of the periods above, please provide, as at the date of your response:

The number of PCNs for which an outstanding balance remains.

The total outstanding balance relating to those PCNs.

Please see the answer to Q1 above.

Q5. Please provide the total number of yellow box junction locations currently subject to camera enforcement by the authority.

We do not enforce via camera, therefore the return is as above for the number of TOR's issued for the offence of 'Motor vehicle fail to comply with a non- endorsable traffic sign.

Q6. For yellow box junction PCNs issued during each of the periods above, where available, please provide:

The number of formal representations received.

The number of representations accepted, resulting in the PCN being cancelled.

If your authority does not currently enforce yellow box junction contraventions, please confirm this.

Please see the answer to Q1 above.

THIS INFORMATION HAS BEEN PROVIDED IN RESPONSE TO A REQUEST
UNDER THE FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000, AND IS CORRECT AS AT 28/08/2026