



Response Date:15/07/2026

2026/722 - Firearms Licensing

In response to your recent request for information regarding;

1.How many Firearms certificate variation requests were processed between the dates of 31/12/2025 and 01/01/2026?

None.

2.How many of the variation requests between the dates of 31/12/2025 and 01/01/2026 were requesting permission to increase ammunition possession?

Not Applicable

3.On average how long/ human working hours does it take to process a variation requesting additional permission to increase ammunition on a FAC?

Information not held

4. How many members of Police staff and or Police officers does it take to process a FAC Variation request for an increase in ammunition on the holders FAC?

Information not held

5.On average how many hours does a home FEO visit take for a renewal of FAC?

Information not held

6.During a FEO renewal visit how much time is taken up counting individual rounds of ammunition ensuring compliance with the amount permitted on the holders FAC?

Information not held

THIS INFORMATION HAS BEEN PROVIDED IN RESPONSE TO A REQUEST
UNDER THE FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000, AND IS CORRECT AS AT 14/07/2026