



HEDDLU
GOGLEDD CYMRU
NORTH WALES
POLICE

Response Date:16/09/2025

2025/910 - Digital domestic abuse

In response to your recent request for information regarding;

1. The number of crimes recorded considered to be digital domestic abuse within, for example, this framework: <https://www.met.police.uk/advice/advice-and-information/daa/domestic-abuse/digital-domestic-abuse/>

a) Out of these, how many resulted in arrests?

**Notifiable Offences + Domestic Abuse
NICL Qualifier and Cyber Enabled or
Cyber Dependent Local Qualifier.
Convictions data not held on Niche RMS**

Calendar Year	Count	Crimes + Arrest ID
2022	949	94
2023	884	134
2024	1284	205

b) How many of these resulted in a conviction?

North Wales Police do not hold this information. For conviction data you will need to re-direct your enquiry to the Crown Prosecution Service.

THIS INFORMATION HAS BEEN PROVIDED IN RESPONSE TO A REQUEST
UNDER THE FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000, AND IS CORRECT AS AT 11/09/2025

Pencadlys yr Heddlu,
Glan-y-Don, Bae Colwyn LL29 8AW
www.heddlugogleddcymru.police.uk

Police Headquarters,
Glan-y-Don, Colwyn Bay LL29 8AW
www.northwales.police.uk

Yn gwneud Gogledd Cymru'r lle mwyaf diogel i fyw, gweithio ac ymweld yn y DU
Making North Wales the safest place to live, work and visit in the UK