



HEDDLU
GOGLEDD CYMRU
NORTH WALES
POLICE

Response Date:06/05/2025

2025/405 - Road Traffic Collision Data (2022–2024)

In response to your recent request for information regarding;

I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 regarding road traffic collisions within your jurisdiction for the years 2022, 2023, and 2024.

We would like this data first at the total jurisdiction level and then broken down by the five most populous areas, as determined by the latest Census data.

1. Car Collisions

For your entire jurisdiction, please provide:

- The total number of reported road traffic collisions each year.
- The most common roads where collisions occurred (top five per year).
- The postcode areas with the highest number of collisions (top five per year) and the postcode areas with the lowest number of collisions (bottom five).
- The primary contributory factors (e.g., speeding, reckless driving, driving under the influence, weather conditions, etc.).
- The make and model of vehicles involved in these collisions.

For each of the five most populous areas within your area, please provide:

- The number of reported road traffic collisions each year.
- The most common roads where collisions occurred (top five per year).
- The postcode areas with the highest number of collisions (top five per year).
- The primary contributory factors.
- The make and model of vehicles involved.

2. Pedestrian Collisions

For your entire jurisdiction, please provide:

- The total number of reported pedestrian-related collisions each year.
- The most common roads where pedestrian-related collisions occurred (top five per year).
- The postcode areas with the highest number of pedestrian-related collisions (top five per year) and the postcode areas with the lowest number of pedestrian-related collisions (bottom five per year).
- The types of pedestrian crossings where these collisions occurred (e.g., zebra crossings, signal-controlled crossings, uncontrolled crossings, etc.).
- The primary contributory factors.

For each of the five most populous areas within your area please provide:

- The number of pedestrian-related collisions each year.

Pencadlys yr Heddlu,
Glan-y-Don, Bae Colwyn LL29 8AW
www.heddlugogleddcymru.police.uk

Police Headquarters,
Glan-y-Don, Colwyn Bay LL29 8AW
www.northwales.police.uk

Yn gwneud Gogledd Cymru'r lle mwyaf diogel i fyw, gweithio ac ymweld yn y DU
Making North Wales the safest place to live, work and visit in the UK

- The most common roads where pedestrian-related collisions occurred (top five per year).
- The postcode areas with the highest number of pedestrian-related collisions (top five per year).
- The types of pedestrian crossings where these collisions occurred.
- The primary contributory factors.

3. Cycling, E-Scooter, and Motorbike Collisions

For your entire jurisdiction, please provide:

- The total number of reported road traffic collisions involving cyclists, e-scooters, and motorbikes each year.
- The most common roads where such collisions occurred (top five per year).
- The postcode areas with the highest number of these collisions (top five per year) and the postcode areas with the lowest number of these collisions (bottom five per year).
- The primary contributory factors.

For each of the five most populous areas within your area, please provide:

- The number of reported road traffic collisions involving cyclists, e-scooters, and motorbikes each year.
- The most common roads where such collisions occurred (top five per year).
- The postcode areas with the highest number of these collisions (top five per year).
- The primary contributory factors.

Please note: The injury road traffic collision (RTC) data is sourced from the Home Office Stats19 returns for the period of 01/01/2022-31/12/2024. Please note that 2024 data is considered provisional, therefore subject to change. The data was refined to include collisions involving cars, pedestrians, pedal cyclists and motorcyclists. There is not a vehicle type code included for e-scooters on the stats 19 therefore search for "e-scooter" in other vehicle types was conducted.

The vehicle make and model was not introduced to the Stats19 until 2022, therefore this data was not held for all collisions.

There can be up to 6 contributory factors recorded per collision.

There can be multiple vehicles involved in one collision.

The most populous local authorities in North Wales as per the latest Census data are as follows: Conwy, Denbighshire, Flintshire, Gwynedd & Wrexham.

1. Car Collisions

For your entire jurisdiction, please provide:

- The total number of reported road traffic collisions each year.

	2022	2023	2024	Total
Total	675	650	434	1759

- The most common roads where collisions occurred (top five per year).

2022

Road	Count
Unclassified	246
A548	33
A55	32
A5	30
A547	23

2023

Road	Count
Unclassified	231
A525	34
A548	33
A55	22
A5	21

2024

Road	Count
Unclassified	140
A55	27
A548	22
A525	16
A547	16

· The postcode areas with the highest number of collisions (top five per year) and the postcode areas with the lowest number of collisions (bottom five).

Not recorded within Stats 19.

· The primary contributory factors (e.g., speeding, reckless driving, driving under the influence, weather conditions, etc.).

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	523
2	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	353
3	406	Failed to judge other persons path or speed (vehicle)	328
4	410	Loss of control	287
5	403	Poor turn or manoeuvre	224

· The make and model of vehicles involved in these collisions.

There are 652 different makes and models of cars alone involved in these collisions, therefore the top 10 have been provided:

Make	Model	Count
FORD	FIESTA	107
VAUXHALL	CORSA	100
VAUXHALL	ASTRA	90
VOLKSWAGEN	GOLF	77
FORD	FOCUS	64
RENAULT	CLIO	41
VOLKSWAGEN	POLO	41
AUDI	A3	33
HONDA	CIVIC	30
NISSAN	QASHQAI	30

For each of the five most populous areas within your area, please provide:

· The number of reported road traffic collisions each year.

Local Authority	2022	2023	2024	Total
Wrexham	134	116	78	328
Denbighshire	102	125	77	304

Flintshire	139	160	107	406
Gwynedd	134	115	69	318
Conwy	119	88	65	272
Total	675	650	434	1759

· The most common roads where collisions occurred (top five per year).

Conwy

Road	Count
<i>Unclassified</i>	93
A547	38
A470	30
A548	29
A55	24

Denbighshire

Road	Count
<i>Unclassified</i>	115
A525	40
A548	21
A5	14
B5119	14

Flintshire

Road	Count
<i>Unclassified</i>	153
A548	37
A55	33
A541	25
A5026	22

Gwynedd

Road	Count
<i>Unclassified</i>	85
A487	44
A496	20
A497	18
A499	16

Wrexham

Road	Count
<i>Unclassified</i>	133
A525	28
A483	22
A5152	18
A541	17

· The postcode areas with the highest number of collisions (top five per year).

Not recorded within Stats 19.

· *The primary contributory factors.*

Conwy

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	88
2	406	Failed to judge other persons path or speed (vehicle)	58
3	410	Loss of control	45
4	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	45
5	403	Poor turn or manoeuvre	43

Denbighshire

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	86
2	410	Loss of control	50
3	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	48
4	406	Failed to judge other persons path or speed (vehicle)	45
5	403	Poor turn or manoeuvre	43

Flintshire

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	132
2	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	82
3	406	Failed to judge other persons path or speed (vehicle)	81
4	410	Loss of control	47
5	403	Poor turn or manoeuvre	45

Gwynedd

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	82
2	410	Loss of control	80
3	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	78
4	406	Failed to judge other persons path or speed (vehicle)	58
5	307	Travelling too fast for conditions	43

Wrexham

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	99
2	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	71
3	406	Failed to judge other persons path or speed (vehicle)	69
4	410	Loss of control	43
5	403	Poor turn or manoeuvre	31

· *The make and model of vehicles involved.*

Conwy

Make	Model	Count
VAUXHALL	CORSA	7
VAUXHALL	ASTRA	6
SEAT	IBIZA	5
LAND ROVER	DISCOVERY	5

KIA	SPORTAGE	5
-----	----------	---

Denbighshire

Make	Model	Count
FORD	FIESTA	14
FORD	FOCUS	10
VAUXHALL	ASTRA	10
VAUXHALL	CORSA	7
VOLKSWAGEN	GOLF	6

Flintshire

Make	Model	Count
FORD	FIESTA	24
VAUXHALL	ASTRA	15
VAUXHALL	CORSA	15
RENAULT	CLIO	13
VOLKSWAGEN	GOLF	11

Gwynedd

Make	Model	Count
FORD	FIESTA	14
FORD	FOCUS	12
VOLKSWAGEN	GOLF	8
TOYOTA	YARIS	7
VAUXHALL	CORSA	7

Wrexham

Make	Model	Count
VAUXHALL	ASTRA	16
FORD	FIESTA	13
VAUXHALL	CORSA	12
VOLKSWAGEN	GOLF	9
PEUGEOT	308	8

2. Pedestrian Collisions

For your entire jurisdiction, please provide:

· The total number of reported pedestrian-related collisions each year.

	2022	2023	2024	Total
Total	182	147	111	440

· The most common roads where pedestrian-related collisions occurred (top five per year).
2022

Road	Count
Unclassified	104
A548	10
A547	7
A525	5

A5152	4
-------	---

2023

Road	Count
Unclassified	83
A548	8
A525	5
A547	4
A494	3

2024

Road	Count
Unclassified	55
A548	6
A547	5
A5025	4
A525	3

· The postcode areas with the highest number of pedestrian-related collisions (top five per year) and the postcode areas with the lowest number of pedestrian-related collisions (bottom five per year).
Not recorded within Stats 19.

· The types of pedestrian crossings where these collisions occurred (e.g., zebra crossings, signal-controlled crossings, uncontrolled crossings, etc.).

Crossing facilities	Count
Central refuge - no other controls	14
No physical crossing facility within Pedestrian phase at traffic signal junction	342
Pedestrian phase at traffic signal junction	17
Pelican, puffin, toucan or similar non-junction pedestrian light crossing	52
Zebra crossing	15

· The primary contributory factors.

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	802	Failed to look properly (Pedestrian)	148
2	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	84
3	808	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Pedestrian)	63
4	803	Failed to judge vehicles path or speed (Pedestrian)	56
5	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	55

For each of the five most populous areas within your area please provide:

· The number of pedestrian-related collisions each year.

Local Authority	2022	2023	2024	Grand Total
Conwy	32	28	19	79
Denbighshire	39	29	21	89
Flintshire	38	29	24	91
Gwynedd	25	30	11	66
Wrexham	40	21	23	84
Grand Total	174	137	98	409

· The most common roads where pedestrian-related collisions occurred (top five per year).

Conwy

Road	Count
Unclassified	41
A547	13
A548	10
A470	4
A546	3

Denbighshire

Road	Count
Unclassified	51
A548	7
A525	6
B5119	5
B5120	4

Flintshire

Road	Count
Unclassified	48
A548	7
A5026	5
A549	4
B5444	4

Gwynedd

Road	Count
Unclassified	33
A497	5
A4087	3
A494	3
A496	3

Wrexham

Road	Count
Unclassified	52
A525	6
A5152	5
A541	4
A483	3

· The postcode areas with the highest number of pedestrian-related collisions (top five per year).

Not recorded within Stats 19.

· The types of pedestrian crossings where these collisions occurred.

Conwy

Crossing Facilities	Count
Central refuge - no other controls	4
No physical crossing facility within Pedestrian phase at traffic signal junction0m	49
Pedestrian phase at traffic signal junction	6

Pelican, puffin, toucan or similar non-junction pedestrian light crossing	15
Zebra crossing	5
Grand Total	79

Denbighshire

Crossing Facilities	Count
Central refuge - no other controls	4
No physical crossing facility within Pedestrian phase at traffic signal junction0m	69
Pedestrian phase at traffic signal junction	3
Pelican, puffin, toucan or similar non-junction pedestrian light crossing	8
Zebra crossing	5
Grand Total	89

Flintshire

Crossing Facilities	Count
Central refuge - no other controls	3
No physical crossing facility within Pedestrian phase at traffic signal junction0m	73
Pedestrian phase at traffic signal junction	3
Pelican, puffin, toucan or similar non-junction pedestrian light crossing	11
Zebra crossing	1
Grand Total	91

Gwynedd

Crossing Facilities	Count
Central refuge - no other controls	2
No physical crossing facility within Pedestrian phase at traffic signal junction0m	53
Pedestrian phase at traffic signal junction	1
Pelican, puffin, toucan or similar non-junction pedestrian light crossing	8
Zebra crossing	2
Grand Total	66

Wrexham

Crossing Facilities	Count
No physical crossing facility within Pedestrian phase at traffic signal junction0m	73
Pedestrian phase at traffic signal junction	4
Pelican, puffin, toucan or similar non-junction pedestrian light crossing	6
Zebra crossing	1
Grand Total	84

· The primary contributory factors.

Conwy

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	802	Failed to look properly (Pedestrian)	25
2	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	17

3	803	Failed to judge vehicles path or speed (Pedestrian)	13
4	808	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Pedestrian)	11
5	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	8

Denbighshire

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	802	Failed to look properly (Pedestrian)	31
2	808	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Pedestrian)	19
3	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	15
4	803	Failed to judge vehicles path or speed (Pedestrian)	11
5	801	Crossed road masked by stationary or parked vehicle	10

Flintshire

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	802	Failed to look properly (Pedestrian)	34
2	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	17
3	803	Failed to judge vehicles path or speed (Pedestrian)	12
4	808	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Pedestrian)	11
5	801	Crossed road masked by stationary or parked vehicle	10

Gwynedd

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	802	Failed to look properly (Pedestrian)	22
2	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	13
3	808	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Pedestrian)	11
4	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	10
5	803	Failed to judge vehicles path or speed (Pedestrian)	8

Wrexham

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	802	Failed to look properly (Pedestrian)	27
2	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	18
3	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	17
4	808	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Pedestrian)	11
5	803	Failed to judge vehicles path or speed (Pedestrian)	9

3. Cycling, E-Scooter, and Motorbike Collisions

For your entire jurisdiction, please provide:

· The total number of reported road traffic collisions involving cyclists, e-scooters, and motorbikes each year.

	2022	2023	2024
Motorcyclist	146	144	95
Pedal Cyclist	94	80	52
E-scooter	2	5	1

· The most common roads where such collisions occurred (top five per year).
2022

Road	Count
Unclassified	84
A5	21
A470	14
A525	13
A547	10

2023

Road	Count
Unclassified	83
A5	14
A525	12
A494	11
A548	8

2024

Road	Count
Unclassified	42
A548	9
A5	6
A525	6
A547	6

· The postcode areas with the highest number of these collisions (top five per year) and the postcode areas with the lowest number of these collisions (bottom five per year).

Not recorded within Stats 19.

· The primary contributory factors.

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	237
2	406	Failed to judge other persons path or speed (vehicle)	130
3	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	116
4	403	Poor turn or manoeuvre	113
5	410	Loss of control	111

For each of the five most populous areas within your area, please provide:

· The number of reported road traffic collisions involving cyclists, e-scooters, and motorbikes each year.

Local Authority	2022	2023	2024	Total
Conwy	42	29	20	91
Denbighshire	36	45	25	106
Flintshire	52	61	31	144
Gwynedd	52	44	28	124
Wrexham	43	40	34	117
Total	225	219	138	582

· The most common roads where such collisions occurred (top five per year).

Conwy

Road	Count
Unclassified	27

A547	16
A470	12
A5	10
B5115	6

Denbighshire

Road	Count
Unclassified	35
A525	16
A5	8
A542	7
A494	6

Flintshire

Road	Count
Unclassified	61
A548	14
A550	12
B5129	9
A5104	8

Gwynedd

Road	Count
Unclassified	32
A5	12
A487	10
A494	9
A470	8

Wrexham

Road	Count
Unclassified	45
A525	15
A5152	6
A5156	5
A528	5

· The postcode areas with the highest number of these collisions (top five per year).
Not recorded within Stats 19.

· The primary contributory factors.

Conwy

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	31
2	403	Poor turn or manoeuvre	24
3	410	Loss of control	22
4	406	Failed to judge other persons path or speed (vehicle)	19
5	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	13

Denbighshire

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	36
2	410	Loss of control	25
3	403	Poor turn or manoeuvre	19
4	406	Failed to judge other persons path or speed (vehicle)	15
5	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	13

Flintshire

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	64
2	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	32
3	406	Failed to judge other persons path or speed (vehicle)	31
4	403	Poor turn or manoeuvre	22
5	410	Loss of control	13

Gwynedd

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	38
2	410	Loss of control	33
3	406	Failed to judge other persons path or speed (vehicle)	28
4	403	Poor turn or manoeuvre	28
5	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	23

Wrexham

Rank	Code	Description	Count
1	405	Failed to look properly (Vehicle)	51
2	406	Failed to judge other persons path or speed (vehicle)	32
3	602	Careless/Reckless/In a hurry (Vehicle)	27
4	410	Loss of control	12
5	403	Poor turn or manoeuvre	12

THIS INFORMATION HAS BEEN PROVIDED IN RESPONSE TO A REQUEST
UNDER THE FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000, AND IS CORRECT AS AT 02/05/2025