



**HEDDLU
GOGLEDD CYMRU
NORTH WALES
POLICE**

Response Date:17/10/2025

2025/1023 - Hate Crime

In response to your recent request for information regarding;

- 1. For each month from January 2022 to September 2025 inclusive (i.e. monthly figures), please state how many racial hate crimes were recorded by the police force**
- 2. Please break down the monthly figures in question 1 by the recorded ethnicity of the victim (where applicable)**
- 3. Please break down the monthly figures in question 1 by the recorded ethnicity of the accused offender (where known)**
- 4. For each month from January 2022 to September 2025 inclusive (i.e. monthly figures), please state how many religious hate crimes were recorded by the police force**
- 5. Please break down the monthly figures in question 4 by the recorded religion of the victim (where applicable)**
- 6. Please break down the monthly figures in question 4 by the recorded ethnicity of the victim (where applicable)**
- 7. Please break down the monthly figures in question 4 by the recorded ethnicity (not religion) of the accused offender (where known)**

Please find attached.

- 8. Please state whether, in its response to questions 1-7, the police force has classified anti-Semitic offences as racial hate crimes, religious hate crimes, or both**

Anti-semitic comes under the religion or belief flag - can also be flagged as racial hate.

Duty to assist:

Unlike questions 1-7, question 9 does not ask for the disclosure of statistical data or information about specific offences. Instead, I am asking the police about what type of information it records, under the duty to assist:

- 9. Please could the police force outline what level/type of the following details it records/holds within its information systems in relation to racial and religious hate crimes, and how easily retrievable that information is:**
 - a. Location of offences (for "offline" offences)**
 - b. Outcomes of offences (convictions etc)**
 - c. Specific dates of offences**
 - d. Details of offences (i.e. "what happened")**

9a – we can provide data by LPA area, LA, ward, also location type (if occ MO location fields are completed).

9b – can provide the crime outcomes as per the framework [Crime outcomes in England and Wales: Technical Annex - GOV.UK](#).

Pencadlys yr Heddlu,
Glan-y-Don, Bae Colwyn LL29 8AW
www.heddlugogleddcymru.police.uk

Police Headquarters,
Glan-y-Don, Colwyn Bay LL29 8AW
www.northwales.police.uk

**Yn gwneud Gogledd Cymru'r lle mwyaf diogel i fyw, gweithio ac ymweld yn y DU
Making North Wales the safest place to live, work and visit in the UK**

Conviction data is not held – this would need to be sent to the Crown Prosecution Service.

9c – we could retireve this data.

9d – we can provide offence types/groups.

Specific detailed request about circs would come via occurrence summary field and may involve significant time in checking for and redacting personal information etc.

THIS INFORMATION HAS BEEN PROVIDED IN RESPONSE TO A REQUEST
UNDER THE FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000, AND IS CORRECT AS AT 15/10/2025

Racial Hate Offences + Victim Self Defined Ethnicity

Year	Month	A1. Asian - Indian	A2. Asian - Pakistani	A3. Asian - Bangladeshi	A9. Any other Asian background	B1. Black Caribbean	B2. Black African	B9. Any other Black background	M1. White & Black Caribbean	M2. White & Black African	M3. White & Asian	M9. Any other mixed background	O1. Chinese	O2. Arab	O9. Any other ethnic group	W1. White British	W2. White Irish	W3. White Gypsy or Irish Traveller	W4. White Roma	W9. Any other white background	Not Stated	No SDE Recorded	Bus/org victim	No Victim ID	Offences
2022	January	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	10	0	0	0	3	10	16	4	1	47
2022	February	1	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	1	1	0	14	0	0	0	4	7	24	5	1	60
2022	March	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	17	0	1	0	2	13	23	2	1	61
2022	April	1	1	0	0	0	1	0	0	1	1	0	0	0	2	22	0	2	0	0	11	26	5	2	75
2022	May	0	1	0	0	1	3	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	1	15	0	0	0	2	12	18	3	2	59
2022	June	2	0	0	0	0	4	1	0	0	0	0	1	0	2	20	0	1	0	0	14	28	7	2	82
2022	July	1	0	4	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	3	23	0	0	0	4	7	37	8	5	94
2022	August	0	0	0	3	1	0	0	0	0	1	2	0	0	1	15	0	0	0	4	16	28	7	5	83
2022	September	0	0	0	1	1	3	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	6	1	1	0	4	11	21	5	1	56
2022	October	0	0	0	2	0	2	0	0	1	0	1	0	0	2	20	0	0	0	3	7	20	6	3	67
2022	November	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	0	0	3	16	0	0	0	5	13	23	5	3	71
2022	December	0	0	1	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	13	0	1	0	6	9	11	8	3	54
2023	January	0	1	0	0	0	2	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	14	0	0	0	0	6	15	12	3	54
2023	February	0	0	0	3	0	3	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	8	0	0	0	1	8	24	4	2	54
2023	March	1	0	0	0	2	3	0	0	1	0	1	0	1	0	9	0	1	0	5	14	17	3	1	59
2023	April	0	0	0	0	0	2	1	0	1	0	0	1	0	1	6	0	0	0	1	11	25	9	0	58
2023	May	0	1	1	1	0	2	1	0	1	0	0	0	0	2	11	0	0	0	1	9	28	4	9	71
2023	June	1	0	2	1	1	2	0	1	0	1	1	2	0	3	7	0	1	0	6	11	15	7	6	68
2023	July	0	2	0	0	1	1	0	0	1	1	0	1	0	1	10	0	0	0	2	14	28	2	1	65
2023	August	0	2	1	0	0	2	1	0	0	1	1	0	0	1	7	0	0	0	4	7	17	6	2	52
2023	September	2	0	0	1	1	4	2	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	7	0	0	0	4	10	24	3	0	58
2023	October	2	1	0	0	0	3	0	1	0	0	3	0	0	0	8	0	0	0	4	13	22	5	3	65
2023	November	1	1	0	0	0	3	1	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	3	0	0	0	0	13	13	4	0	40
2023	December	0	1	0	0	2	0	0	1	0	1	2	0	0	1	10	0	0	0	2	9	17	2	1	49

2024	January	1	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	1	7	0	0	0	4	5	16	1	1	38
2024	February	0	1	1	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	1	1	0	1	4	0	1	0	2	9	14	6	1	43
2024	March	0	0	0	0	0	3	0	0	1	0	1	0	0	0	13	0	1	0	1	11	17	8	2	58
2024	April	1	0	0	3	0	0	0	0	0	2	0	1	0	1	6	0	0	0	3	13	19	5	3	57
2024	May	1	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	12	0	1	0	2	12	19	5	3	57
2024	June	0	3	0	1	0	1	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	1	7	0	0	0	4	14	23	7	1	63
2024	July	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	2	0	0	0	0	10	0	0	0	4	25	12	3	6	63
2024	August	2	1	0	6	0	1	4	0	0	0	2	0	1	0	15	0	0	0	4	15	25	6	2	84
2024	September	0	0	0	2	1	6	0	0	1	0	0	1	2	1	9	0	0	0	2	23	6	5	1	60
2024	October	1	2	1	1	1	2	1	0	2	0	0	1	0	1	12	0	1	0	4	24	2	6	2	64
2024	November	4	2	0	2	1	4	2	1	2	0	3	1	1	2	13	0	0	0	2	26	3	4	1	74
2024	December	4	0	1	0	0	1	0	0	0	1	0	1	0	0	8	0	0	0	1	14	0	6	0	37
2025	January	0	2	1	1	1	1	0	0	1	1	3	0	0	1	10	0	0	0	2	8	5	5	1	43
2025	February	0	0	0	1	1	1	1	1	1	0	1	1	1	3	8	0	2	0	2	18	1	9	2	54
2025	March	1	0	0	1	0	2	2	0	1	0	0	2	1	0	15	0	0	0	1	19	4	5	1	55
2025	April	0	2	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	0	2	0	1	12	0	2	0	5	23	4	9	3	65
2025	May	2	1	0	2	1	1	0	1	0	1	0	0	3	0	15	1	1	0	3	22	2	7	0	63
2025	June	2	1	0	2	1	2	0	1	0	0	2	0	0	3	20	0	1	1	0	15	2	8	1	62
2025	July	1	0	0	1	1	5	1	1	1	0	0	0	2	1	19	1	0	0	2	15	1	8	2	62
2025	August	2	1	2	8	2	5	4	0	1	1	0	0	1	6	11	1	0	0	7	16	1	19	4	92
2025	September	5	2	2	0	0	3	1	0	0	2	2	0	0	1	13	0	0	0	5	11	2	8	2	59

Racial Hate Offences + Suspect Self Defined Ethnicity

Multiple Suspects can be linked to each occurrences therefore overall count can exceed the total offence count in the offences/victims table

Year	Month	A1. Asian - Indian	A2. Asian - Pakistani	A3. Asian - Bangladeshi	B1. Black Caribbean	B2. Black African	B9. Any other Black background	M1. White & Black Caribbean	M2. White & Black African	M3. White & Asian	No SDE Recorded	No Suspect ID	Not Stated	O1. Chinese	O9. Any other ethnic group	W1. White British	W2. White Irish	W3. White Gypsy or Irish Traveller	W9. Any other white background	Total
2022	January	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	5	17	4	0	0	23	0	0	0	49
2022	February	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	10	24	6	0	0	24	0	0	1	66
2022	March	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	2	28	3	0	0	25	0	0	2	61
2022	April	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	16	20	11	0	0	36	0	1	0	84
2022	May	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	5	15	11	0	1	26	0	2	3	63
2022	June	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	10	30	12	0	0	35	0	0	0	87
2022	July	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	6	32	11	0	0	45	0	0	2	97
2022	August	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	10	21	2	0	1	48	1	0	1	84
2022	September	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	13	13	8	0	2	19	0	0	4	59
2022	October	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	5	23	3	0	1	37	0	0	0	69
2022	November	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	7	27	7	0	1	32	2	0	0	76
2022	December	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	5	23	8	0	0	16	0	0	2	54
2023	January	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	4	11	8	0	0	36	0	1	2	62
2023	February	0	0	0	1	1	0	0	0	0	10	13	8	0	0	22	0	2	1	58
2023	March	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	5	23	3	0	2	27	1	0	0	61
2023	April	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	11	13	4	2	0	28	0	0	1	59
2023	May	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	8	32	7	0	0	28	0	0	1	76
2023	June	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	6	24	9	0	0	30	1	0	0	70
2023	July	1	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	11	20	9	0	0	25	0	0	0	67
2023	August	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	3	22	12	0	0	14	0	0	2	53
2023	September	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	1	5	18	8	0	1	27	1	0	0	62
2023	October	1	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	4	19	8	0	0	33	0	0	2	68
2023	November	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	16	3	0	0	19	0	0	0	40
2023	December	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	24	9	0	0	14	0	0	0	49
2024	January	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	14	2	0	0	21	1	0	1	40
2024	February	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	5	13	12	0	0	16	0	0	2	49
2024	March	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	12	19	7	0	0	24	0	0	1	64
2024	April	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	10	13	9	0	1	22	0	0	2	58
2024	May	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	5	13	13	0	0	26	0	1	0	58
2024	June	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	6	24	10	0	0	26	1	0	1	68

2024	July	1	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	1	8	19	5	0	1	28	0	0	1	65
2024	August	0	0	0	1	0	0	1	0	0	6	28	11	0	0	37	0	0	1	85
2024	September	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	3	16	15	0	1	27	0	0	1	63
2024	October	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	4	21	11	0	1	31	0	0	1	69
2024	November	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	11	20	15	0	0	27	3	0	2	80
2024	December	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	15	5	0	0	15	0	0	0	38
2025	January	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	9	10	0	0	23	0	0	2	46
2025	February	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	2	7	16	0	0	25	0	0	1	54
2025	March	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	3	12	14	1	0	26	1	0	1	58
2025	April	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	16	14	1	0	29	0	1	4	67
2025	May	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	3	22	11	0	0	30	0	1	0	67
2025	June	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	22	13	0	0	26	0	0	0	63
2025	July	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	20	8	0	3	31	0	0	0	63
2025	August	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	28	9	0	1	49	1	2	4	95
2025	September	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	4	24	7	0	0	24	0	0	0	60

Religious Hate + Victim Self Defined Ethnicity

Year	Month	A2. Asian - Pakistani	A3. Asian - Bangladeshi	A9. Any other Asian background	B1. Black Caribbean	M3. White & Asian	O2. Arab	O9. Any other ethnic group	W1. White British	Not Stated	No SDE Recorded	Bus/org victim	No Victim ID	Offences
2022	January	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	1
2022	February	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	5	0	1	1	0	7
2022	March	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	1
2022	April	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	2	0	0	3
2022	May	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	1	0	0	2
2022	June	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	2	0	3	0	6
2022	July	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	3	1	1	2	0	7
2022	August	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	3	3	0	0	6
2022	September	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	1
2022	October	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	1	0	0	2
2022	November	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	0	0	1	0	3
2022	December	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	2	0	2	0	6
2023	January	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	1	0	1	1	5
2023	February	0	0	2	0	0	0	0	1	0	3	0	0	6
2023	March	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	1	0	3
2023	April	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	2	0	1	6
2023	May	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	3	1	0	5
2023	June	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	4	0	1	1	0	6
2023	July	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	1	0	2
2023	August	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	1	2
2023	September	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	0	0	1	0	3
2023	October	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	2	3	0	6
2023	November	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	0	3	2	0	7
2023	December	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	1	1	0	0	4
2024	January	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	3	0	0	3
2024	February	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	1	2	0	4
2024	March	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	0	2	0	4
2024	April	0	0	1	0	1	0	0	0	1	2	1	1	7
2024	May	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	0	0	0	0	2
2024	June	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	0	0	0	2
2024	July	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	1	1	0	3
2024	August	0	0	0	1	0	0	1	3	1	3	3	2	14
2024	September	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1
2024	October	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	3	0	0	0	0	3
2024	November	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	2
2024	December	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	0	0	1	1	4

2025	January	1	1	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	1	1	0	5
2025	February	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	1	0	0	0	1	3
2025	March	0	0	0	0	0	1	1	1	2	0	2	0	7
2025	April	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	1	0	2
2025	May	0	0	1	0	0	1	0	2	0	0	0	0	4
2025	June	1	0	0	0	0	0	1	3	0	0	2	0	7
2025	July	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	3	0	4
2025	August	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	2	0	3
2025	September	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	1	0	2

Religious Hate + Victim Religion

Year	Month	Christian	COE	Hindu	ISL	Jewish	JOR	Muslim	UNK	Not Recorded/ No person Victim ID type	Offences
2022	January	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	1
2022	February	0	0	0	0	4	0	0	0	3	7
2022	March	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	1
2022	April	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	2	3
2022	May	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	2
2022	June	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	5	6
2022	July	0	0	0	0	4	0	0	0	3	7
2022	August	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	6	6
2022	September	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	1
2022	October	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	1	2
2022	November	2	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	3
2022	December	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	5	6
2023	January	0	0	0	1	1	0	0	0	3	5
2023	February	0	0	0	0	1	0	1	0	4	6
2023	March	0	0	0	0	2	0	0	0	1	3
2023	April	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	5	6
2023	May	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	4	5
2023	June	0	0	0	0	2	0	0	0	4	6
2023	July	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	2
2023	August	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	2
2023	September	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	2	3
2023	October	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	6	6
2023	November	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	6	7
2023	December	0	0	0	0	1	0	1	0	2	4
2024	January	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	3	3
2024	February	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	4	4
2024	March	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	4	4
2024	April	0	0	1	0	0	0	1	0	5	7
2024	May	0	0	0	0	0	2	0	0	0	2
2024	June	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	2
2024	July	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	3	3
2024	August	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	14	14
2024	September	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	1
2024	October	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	3	3
2024	November	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	1	2
2024	December	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	4	4
2025	January	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	4	5
2025	February	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	3	3
2025	March	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	6	7

2025	April	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	2
2025	May	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	4	4
2025	June	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	6	7
2025	July	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	4	4
2025	August	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	3	3
2025	September	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	2
		2	1	1	2	19	3	6	2	150	186

Religious Hate + Suspect Self Defined Ethnicity

Multiple Suspects can be linked to each occurrences therefore overall count can exceed the total offence count in the offences/victims table

Year	Month	B1. Black Caribbean	B2. Black African	No SDE Recorded	No Suspect ID	Not Stated	O1. Chinese	W1. White British	W2. White Irish	W9. Any other white background	Total
2022	January	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	1
2022	February	0	0	1	5	2	0	0	0	0	8
2022	March	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	1
2022	April	0	0	1	2	0	0	0	0	0	3
2022	May	0	0	0	0	1	0	1	0	0	2
2022	June	0	0	0	3	0	0	3	0	0	6
2022	July	0	0	0	1	0	0	6	0	0	7
2022	August	0	0	0	3	2	0	3	0	0	8
2022	September	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0	0	1
2022	October	0	0	0	1	0	0	1	0	0	2
2022	November	0	0	0	2	0	0	1	0	0	3
2022	December	0	0	0	5	0	0	1	0	0	6
2023	January	0	0	0	0	1	0	4	0	0	5
2023	February	0	0	2	2	0	0	2	0	0	6
2023	March	0	0	2	1	0	0	1	0	0	4
2023	April	0	0	0	4	0	2	0	0	0	6
2023	May	0	0	0	3	0	0	2	0	0	5
2023	June	0	0	0	2	1	0	4	0	0	7
2023	July	0	0	0	1	0	0	1	0	0	2
2023	August	0	0	0	2	0	0	0	0	0	2
2023	September	0	0	1	2	0	0	0	0	0	3
2023	October	0	0	1	3	0	0	2	0	0	6
2023	November	0	0	0	5	0	0	2	0	0	7
2023	December	0	0	0	3	0	0	1	0	0	4
2024	January	0	0	0	1	0	0	2	0	1	4
2024	February	0	0	0	2	1	0	1	0	0	4
2024	March	0	0	0	1	2	0	2	0	1	6
2024	April	0	0	0	4	0	0	2	1	0	7
2024	May	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	0	0	2
2024	June	0	0	0	2	0	0	0	0	0	2
2024	July	1	1	1	0	0	0	0	0	0	3
2024	August	0	0	1	7	2	0	3	0	1	14

2024	September	0	0	0	0	0	0	1	0	0	1
2024	October	0	0	0	2	0	0	1	0	0	3
2024	November	0	0	0	2	0	0	0	0	0	2
2024	December	0	0	0	2	1	0	0	1	0	4
2025	January	0	0	0	0	1	0	2	0	2	5
2025	February	0	0	0	1	1	0	1	0	0	3
2025	March	0	0	0	2	1	0	3	1	0	7
2025	April	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	1	0	2
2025	May	0	0	0	4	0	0	0	0	0	4
2025	June	0	0	1	0	0	0	7	0	0	8
2025	July	0	0	0	0	2	0	2	0	0	4
2025	August	0	0	0	1	1	0	1	0	0	3
2025	September	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	0	0	2

Anti-semitic comes under the religion or belief flag - can also be flagged as racial hate

Calendar Year	Calendar Month Long	Hate crime	Anti Jewish	Religion Flag	Racial Flag
2022	January	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2022	February	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2022	February	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2022	February	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2022	February	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2022	February	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2022	April	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2022	June	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;Sexual orientation;	Y	Y	Y
2022	June	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2022	June	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2022	June	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2022	July	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2022	July	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;Sexual orientation;	Y	Y	Y
2022	July	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2022	July	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2022	July	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N

2022	July	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2022	August	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2022	August	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2022	August	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2022	September	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;Sexual orientation;	Y	Y	Y
2022	October	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2022	December	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2023	January	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2023	January	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	January	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	February	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	February	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	March	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2023	March	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	March	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	April	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;Sexual orientation;	Y	Y	Y

2023	April	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Religion or belief - Anti Muslim;	Y	Y	N
2023	May	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2023	May	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	May	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	June	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	June	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2023	June	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	July	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2023	August	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	September	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	September	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	September	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	October	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	October	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	October	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Religion or belief - Anti Muslim;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2023	November	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	November	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N

2023	November	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2023	December	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2023	December	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2024	January	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2024	January	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2024	February	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;Sexual orientation;	Y	Y	Y
2024	February	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2024	February	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Sexual orientation;	Y	Y	N
2024	March	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2024	April	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2024	May	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2024	June	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2024	July	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2024	August	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2024	October	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2024	May	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2025	February	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N

2025	February	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2025	March	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2025	March	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2025	March	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2025	March	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;	Y	Y	Y
2025	April	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;Racial;Sexual orientation;	Y	Y	Y
2025	April	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2025	May	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N
2025	June	;Religion or belief - Anti Jewish;	Y	Y	N